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A classic developmental skills text for lower-intermediate and intermediate English language learners,  
Fundamentals of English Grammar   is a comprehensive reference grammar as well as a stimulating and
teachable classroom text. (Volume B contains Chapters 8-14.)
 
While keeping the same basic approach and material as in earlier editions, the fourth edition more fully
develops communicative and interactive language-learning activities. Some of the new features are:

Innovative Warm-Up exercises that precede the grammar charts and introduce points to be taught●

Structure-based listening exercises ranging from casual speech to more academic content●

A wide selection of readings that highlight the target grammar structures●

Greatly expanded speaking practice with extensive pair, group, and class work●

Writing activities with models for students to follow●

Corpus-informed syllabus that reflects the discourse patterns of spoken and written English●

Audio CDs and Listening Script in the back of the Student Book●
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From reader reviews:

Frank Hegarty:

The event that you get from Fundamentals of English Grammar, Volume B (4th Edition) may be the more
deep you excavating the information that hide inside words the more you get interested in reading it. It
doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but Fundamentals of English Grammar, Volume B (4th
Edition) giving you excitement feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in specific way that can be
understood by anyone who read it because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. This particular
book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go to
you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having that Fundamentals
of English Grammar, Volume B (4th Edition) instantly.

Alison McGowan:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a publication will give you a lot of
new data. When you read a publication you will get new information due to the fact book is one of many
ways to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, examining a book will make anyone more
imaginative. When you looking at a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to definitely
imagine the story how the personas do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other people.
When you read this Fundamentals of English Grammar, Volume B (4th Edition), you can tells your family,
friends in addition to soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading
a publication.

Tony Partee:

You will get this Fundamentals of English Grammar, Volume B (4th Edition) by check out the bookstore or
Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties to your knowledge.
Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only by written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book by
simply e-book. In the modern era just like now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what
your problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your guide. It is most
important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose correct
ways for you.

Jonathan Sanders:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is published or printed or outlined from each source that will filled update of news. With
this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just seeking the
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