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All three novels in the Deal for Love series featuring Cassi and
Jared

Cassi is the head buyer for a prestigious art gallery in California. Jared is a buyer for an exclusive New York
gallery. Sparks fly as the two come head to head in a bidding war for a hideous but very expensive Indian
Buddha. During a string of hair-raising exploits, Cassi and Jared are forced to develop a tentative friendship
that deepens into romance. Will they survive long enough to see it through?

Bestselling author Rachel Ann Nunes has crafted a wonderfully intriguing and romantic drama in this fast-
moving romantic suspense trilogy, bringing two idealistic people together from opposite edges of the
continent and allowing them, in their own way, to find an unexpected connection to their Christian faith and
each other. In the end, their very lives depend on the trust they’ve developed.

Includes 3 full Christian novels:

A Bid for Love
Framed for Love
Love on the Run
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From reader reviews:

Gloria Wells:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the e-book entitled Deal for Love: 3 Book Set. Try to stumble through book
Deal for Love: 3 Book Set as your pal. It means that it can for being your friend when you sense alone and
beside associated with course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The
book makes you more confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , we should
make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Thomas Krieg:

As people who live in the modest era should be revise about what going on or facts even knowledge to make
all of them keep up with the era and that is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe will update
themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to you is you don't
know what one you should start with. This Deal for Love: 3 Book Set is our recommendation so you keep up
with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Bridgett Killion:

This Deal for Love: 3 Book Set is great publication for you because the content which can be full of
information for you who always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. That book reveal it
data accurately using great arrange word or we can point out no rambling sentences included. So if you are
read the idea hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward
sentences but difficult core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having Deal for Love: 3 Book
Set in your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that
no publication that offer you world in ten or fifteen moment right but this reserve already do that. So , this
can be good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt this?

Ella McCoy:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is different. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the
most beneficial book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is named of
book Deal for Love: 3 Book Set. You can add your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it
might add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about
guide. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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