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About the Author

John Burroughs was born April 3, 1837, near the town of Roxbury in the Catskill Mountains. Growing up on
his parents' farm, he absorbed much of the nature and country life that he would later write about in his many
volumes.

He taught briefly, married, and during the Civil War settled in Washington, D.C. where he obtained a job as
a clerk in the Treasury Department. It was during his nine years in Washington that he published his first
book, Wake-Robin. In 1873 he returned to New York State and established his home "Riverby" on the west
bank of the Hudson River at West Park. He began fruit farming and continued to write, publishing a new
books about every two years.
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From reader reviews:

Willie Hodges:

The book The Breath of Life (Complete Writings of John Burroughs) can give more knowledge and also the
precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave a good thing like a book The
Breath of Life (Complete Writings of John Burroughs)? A few of you have a different opinion about book.
But one aim that will book can give many info for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer with your
book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you could share all of
these. Book The Breath of Life (Complete Writings of John Burroughs) has simple shape but you know: it
has great and massive function for you. You can seem the enormous world by start and read a book. So it is
very wonderful.

Robin Millard:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children till adult are different content. We all know that that
book is very important for us. The book The Breath of Life (Complete Writings of John Burroughs) ended up
being making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is
extremely advantages for you. The guide The Breath of Life (Complete Writings of John Burroughs) is not
only giving you a lot more new information but also to become your friend when you experience bored. You
can spend your spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship with all the book The Breath of
Life (Complete Writings of John Burroughs). You never really feel lose out for everything if you read some
books.

Erica Lewis:

This The Breath of Life (Complete Writings of John Burroughs) are reliable for you who want to become a
successful person, why. The explanation of this The Breath of Life (Complete Writings of John Burroughs)
can be one of many great books you must have is actually giving you more than just simple reading through
food but feed a person with information that maybe will shock your prior knowledge. This book is actually
handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions in e-book and printed versions.
Beside that this The Breath of Life (Complete Writings of John Burroughs) forcing you to have an enormous
of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that could it useful in your day
activity. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Robert Rascoe:

This book untitled The Breath of Life (Complete Writings of John Burroughs) to be one of several books in
which best seller in this year, that's because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit on it. You
will easily to buy that book in the book retail outlet or you can order it by using online. The publisher in this
book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, because you can read this book in your
Mobile phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this guide from your list.
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