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Well known authors and speakers Ariel and Shya Kane continue to discover and define relationships in their
new book How to Have A Match Made in Heaven:  A Transformational Approach to Dating, Relating, and
Marriage.  Relationship coaches for almost thirty years they have succeeded in guiding many individuals
and couples toward effective communication and personal transformation.  How to Have A Match Made in
Heaven not only shares many of these sessions in print but also points the reader to the authors' website,
where videos of the actual conversations can be viewed.  This unique approach, designed to illustrate the
insights and break-through moments of individuals and couples, presents real and practical ways for the
reader to have their own transformational moments. Based on the Three Principles of Instantaneous
Transformation, as outlined in Working on Yourself Doesn't Work and the award-winning How to Create a
Magical Relationship, this new book moves relationships into a new and satisfying level, where couples
realize that judgment, resentment, or blame can be overcome by simply living in the moment. Ridding
oneself of the need to change yourself or others can be, and often is, a transformational moment leading to
positive, powerful changes in one's relationships. In Match Made in Heaven, you will meet ordinary,
everyday people, in all walks of life, who face the same concerns and fears that we all face, especially the
fear that they will not have a happy, committed relationship with another person.  But as they start to grasp
the meaning of the Three Principles of Instantaneous Transformation they begin to understand that if they
just experience life from moment to moment, the obstacles and fears that surround them often disappear,
leaving them to view their world in a fresh, vibrant, and exciting new way. This unique book includes links
to companion streaming videos and audios of the Kanes working with clients. These mini-sessions allow you
to feel like you are right there having a direct experience of those aha moments when a person's life
transforms in an instant.
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From reader reviews:

Walter McBride:

Here thing why this particular How to Have A Match Made in Heaven: A Transformational Approach to
Dating, Relating, and Marriage are different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all studying a book is good
however it depends in the content from it which is the content is as yummy as food or not. How to Have A
Match Made in Heaven: A Transformational Approach to Dating, Relating, and Marriage giving you
information deeper since different ways, you can find any guide out there but there is no book that similar
with How to Have A Match Made in Heaven: A Transformational Approach to Dating, Relating, and
Marriage. It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing in which
happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in
playground, café, or even in your means home by train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the
printed book maybe the form of How to Have A Match Made in Heaven: A Transformational Approach to
Dating, Relating, and Marriage in e-book can be your choice.

Anna Harlow:

This book untitled How to Have A Match Made in Heaven: A Transformational Approach to Dating,
Relating, and Marriage to be one of several books which best seller in this year, that's because when you read
this reserve you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book store or
you can order it by way of online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to
read this book, because you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason to your
account to past this book from your list.

Leticia Nielson:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, classifieds,
book, and soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended to your account is How to Have A Match Made in Heaven: A Transformational Approach to
Dating, Relating, and Marriage this e-book consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world
now. That book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The language styles that writer value to
explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some investigation when he makes this book. This is
why this book suited all of you.

Andre Todd:

As we know that book is important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a publication we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every
year was exactly added. This reserve How to Have A Match Made in Heaven: A Transformational Approach



to Dating, Relating, and Marriage was filled regarding science. Spend your time to add your knowledge
about your scientific research competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading a book. If you
know how big benefit from a book, you can sense enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like at this point,
many ways to get book that you just wanted.
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