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BANNED: The Golden Book of Chemistry Experiments was a children’s chemistry book written in the
1960s by Robert Brent and illustrated by Harry Lazarus, showing how to set up your own home laboratory
and conduct over 200 experiments. The book is controversial, as many of the experiments contained in the
book are now considered too dangerous for the general public. There are apparently only 126 copies of this
book in libraries worldwide. Despite this, its known as one of the best DIY chemistry books every published.
The book was a source of inspiration to David Hahn, nicknamed "the Radioactive Boy Scout" by the media,
who tried to collect a sample of every chemical element and also built a model nuclear reactor (nuclear
reactions however are not covered in this book), which led to the involvement of the authorities. On the other
hand, it has also been the inspiration for many children who went on to get advanced degrees and productive
chemical careers in industry or academia.
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From reader reviews:

Sang Weems:

This The Golden Book of Chemistry Experiments: How to Set up a Home Laboratory--Over 200 Simple
Experiments book is not really ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you
will get by reading this book is information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get details which
is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. This kind of The Golden Book of Chemistry
Experiments: How to Set up a Home Laboratory--Over 200 Simple Experiments without we comprehend
teach the one who reading it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't end up being worry The
Golden Book of Chemistry Experiments: How to Set up a Home Laboratory--Over 200 Simple Experiments
can bring if you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it
within your lovely laptop even phone. This The Golden Book of Chemistry Experiments: How to Set up a
Home Laboratory--Over 200 Simple Experiments having great arrangement in word and layout, so you will
not experience uninterested in reading.

Harry Anderson:

The ability that you get from The Golden Book of Chemistry Experiments: How to Set up a Home
Laboratory--Over 200 Simple Experiments will be the more deep you digging the information that hide into
the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to
understand but The Golden Book of Chemistry Experiments: How to Set up a Home Laboratory--Over 200
Simple Experiments giving you excitement feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in selected
way that can be understood by means of anyone who read this because the author of this publication is well-
known enough. This specific book also makes your vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand
then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having this
particular The Golden Book of Chemistry Experiments: How to Set up a Home Laboratory--Over 200
Simple Experiments instantly.

Hermelinda Anthony:

This book untitled The Golden Book of Chemistry Experiments: How to Set up a Home Laboratory--Over
200 Simple Experiments to be one of several books this best seller in this year, here is because when you
read this publication you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book
retail store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes
you quicker to read this book, since you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason for
your requirements to past this reserve from your list.

Samantha Smith:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind ability or
thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in comparison with can



satisfy your short period of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find e-book that
need more time to be study. The Golden Book of Chemistry Experiments: How to Set up a Home
Laboratory--Over 200 Simple Experiments can be your answer given it can be read by an individual who
have those short extra time problems.
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