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According to the United Nations' latest data, the United States has more children living in poverty than any
other industrialized nation in the world. More than a fifth of all children grow up in poverty. The poverty
rates for African-American and Latino children often exceeds 40 percent. Furthermore, the United States--a
country that once pioneered strategies to prevent child abuse and that now spends more money fighting child
abuse than any other industrialized country--also has the highest rate of child abuse in the industrialized
world.

Against this background, Duncan Lindsey, a leading authority on child welfare, takes a critical look at the
current welfare system. He traces the transformation of child welfare into child protective services, arguing
that the current focus on abuse has produced a system that is designed to protect children from physical and
sexual abuse and therefore functions as a last resort for only the worst and most dramatic cases in child
welfare. In a close analysis of the process of investigating child abuse, Linsey finds that there is no evidence
that the transformation into protective services has reduced child abuse fatalities or provided a safter
environment for children. He makes a compelling argument for the criminal justice system to assume
responsibility for the problem of child abuse in order for the child welfare system to be able to adequately
address the well-being of a much larger number of children now growing up in poverty.

This new edition of The Welfare of Children takes into account a major legislative change since the
publication of the first edition: the welfare reform legislation of 1996. This legislation has fundamentally
altered the public child welfare system as broadly understood, and Lindsey thoroughly examines its
implications on policy and practice, refuting the claim that welfare reform has actually reduced child
poverty. The Welfare of Children, 2nd Edition is a compassionate blueprint for the comprehensive reform of
the current child welfare system to one that administers to the economic security of the larger number of
disadvantaged and impoverished children. Concrete policy proposals such as a Child's Future Security
account, similar to the Social Security program for older citizens, will spark serious debate on a major public
policy issue facing our society.
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From reader reviews:

James Bauer:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? That's why, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or even read a book titled The Welfare of
Children? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time with
the favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have
different opinion?

Edward McCain:

The book The Welfare of Children gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You need to use
to make your capable much more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting tension or
having big problem together with your subject. If you can make studying a book The Welfare of Children to
be your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge
about many or all subjects. You can know everything if you like open and read a reserve The Welfare of
Children. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do
you think about this book?

Joan Ortega:

As people who live in often the modest era should be up-date about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make these individuals keep up with the era and that is always change and make progress. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to
anyone is you don't know what type you should start with. This The Welfare of Children is our
recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and need
in this era.

Joseph Langley:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you might
have it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This kind of The Welfare of Children can give you a lot
of good friends because by you checking out this one book you have factor that they don't and make anyone
more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of a step for you to get success. This reserve
offer you information that might be your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than various other make
you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We need to have The Welfare of Children.
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