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Markham is often described as "the first person" to fly the Atlantic east to west in a solo non-stop flight,
though most now dispute this claim. When Markham decided to take on the Atlantic crossing, no pilot had
yet flown non-stop from Europe to New York, and no woman had made the westward flight solo, though
several had died trying. Markham hoped to claim both records. She took off from Abingdon, England. After
a 20-hour flight she crash-landed at Baleine Cove on Cape Breton Island, Nova Scotia. In spite of falling
short of her goal, Markham had become the first woman to cross the Atlantic east-to-west solo, and the first
person to make it from England to North America non-stop. She was celebrated as an aviation pioneer.
Markham chronicled her many adventures in her memoir, West with the Night, published by BN Publishing.
After living for many years in the United States, Markham moved back to Kenya, becoming for a time the
most successful horse trainer in the country.
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From reader reviews:

Francis Dawson:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them family
or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, as well
as playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity here is look different you can
read a new book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the entire day to
reading a e-book. The book West with the Night it is quite good to read. There are a lot of folks that
recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space
bringing this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from the smart
phone. The price is not too expensive but this book offers high quality.

David Henry:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Aim to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its cover may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the
outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer may be West with the Night why because the fantastic cover
that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is
definitely fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly direct you to pick up
this book.

Ernesto Harrell:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This book West with the Night was colourful and of course has
pictures on there. As we know that book West with the Night has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until
adolescents. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and believe you are the
character on there. So , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and
relax. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading that will.

Richard Pascual:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got college students? We believe that that
question was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. So you
know that little person similar to reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to know that
reading is very important in addition to book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to include you
knowledge, except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update concerning
something by book. Different categories of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is
West with the Night.
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