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A collection of pre-Menace cartoons from the Merchant of Dennis.

Although best known as one of the greatest syndicated cartoonists of the twentieth century, Dennis the
Menace creator Henry "Hank" Ketcham also spent nearly a decade as a gag cartoonist for major New York
magazines like Colliers and the Saturday Evening Post. In these gag cartoons, which were primarily
published between 1942 and 1950, one can already see the endearing troublemaker that would become the
protagonist in his long-running strip. (In fact, in his Dennis the Menace cartoons, Ketcham reused some of
the gags and images almost verbatim.) Influenced by Virgil Partch and other artists he met during his early
days at Disney animation and as an artist banging on doors in New York, Ketcham's trademark visual humor
and unerring line work are also very evident in these pre-Dennis cartoons.

Like many young cartoonists of his era, Ketcham spent much of WWII drawing. As a Navy man, he created
food conservation and "Jap-bashing" posters during the day, and at night, he moonlighted as a magazine gag
cartoonist producing primarily war-themed gag cartoons, including the regular feature "Half Hitch" for the
Saturday Evening Post. At the end of his tour, he turned down a chance to return to a guaranteed job at
Disney. As it turned out, the siren song of magazine cartooning, which at the time was considered one of the
pinnacles of the applied arts, proved just too strong. For the next five years, he was a regular contributor to
True, Colliers, and the Saturday Evening Post. On the rare occasion, he even made it into The New Yorker,
whose ranks at the time included Peter Arno, James Thurber, and Charles Addams.

Collected for the first time are hundreds of Ketcham's long forgotten magazine cartoons. Together they
provide a rare glimpse into what would later become one the most beloved comics to grace the comics pages.
Illustrated throughout with color and black-and-white cartoons and drawings
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From reader reviews:

Marla Mestas:

The book Where's Dennis? The Magazine Cartoon Art of Hank Ketcham can give more knowledge and
information about everything you want. Why must we leave the good thing like a book Where's Dennis? The
Magazine Cartoon Art of Hank Ketcham? Several of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim
this book can give many info for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer with the book.
Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you may share all of these.
Book Where's Dennis? The Magazine Cartoon Art of Hank Ketcham has simple shape however you know: it
has great and big function for you. You can seem the enormous world by available and read a guide. So it is
very wonderful.

Charles Killough:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading habit give
you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the
book which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want have more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want experience happy read
one having theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Typically the Where's Dennis? The Magazine
Cartoon Art of Hank Ketcham is kind of guide which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Jerald Higgins:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, brief story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not trying Where's Dennis? The Magazine Cartoon
Art of Hank Ketcham that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied through reading this book.
Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the way for people to know world far better then how they
react in the direction of the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky
individual but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for all of you who want to start
examining as your good habit, you could pick Where's Dennis? The Magazine Cartoon Art of Hank Ketcham
become your personal starter.

Pedro Gonzales:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This particular book Where's Dennis? The Magazine Cartoon Art of
Hank Ketcham was bright colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Where's
Dennis? The Magazine Cartoon Art of Hank Ketcham has many kinds or category. Start from kids until
adolescents. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and think you are the character on there.
Therefore , not at all of book are make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to
choose the best book in your case and try to like reading this.
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